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 Aksh, MTNL Rolls Out IPTV Without Broadband Connection
 TopNews - Noida,Uttar Pradesh,India
 The 'i' in icontrol symbolizes the interactivity factor prevalent in IPTV (Internet Protocol Television). The company
provides its subscribers with more ... 

 Dollond & Aitchison launches IPTV blitz
 PrecisionMarketing - London,England,UK
 High street optician Dollond & Aitchison (D&A) is embarking on an innovative campaign to target students through IPTV.
The campaign will run during Channel ...

 Pixelmetrix Danny Wilson To Give The Scoops On IPTV ...
 broadcastbuyer.tv (press release) - London,UK

 Danny Wilson, Pixelmetrix President & CEO, will present an IPTV paper at the Bits of QoS and Bits of Measurement
session on June 20, Day 4 of BroadcastAsia ...

 China Telecom invites bids for over 500000 IPTV terminals
 TelecomTiger - New Delhi,India
 China Telecom has begun inviting bids for IPTV 2.0 terminals using a unified bidding procedure with an aim to cut secret
deals between terminal and system ...

 ZyXEL unveils wireless gateway and IPTV set-top box
 Telecom Paper (subscription) - Houten,Netherlands

 Broadband technology provider ZyXEL Communications has unveiled two products, the P-660HNU series 802.11n
ADSL2/2+ wireless gateway and the STB-1001 IPTV ...

Amino Introduces First 100% Digital, High Definition (HD) IPTV Set ...
 Business Wire (press release) - San Francisco,CA,USA
 With HDMI as the only available method of connection to the TV, the AmiNET130M is cheaper and simpler to install than
other HD IPTV STBs. ... 

 Tech Mahindra Enters Into Strategic Internet Protocol TV (IPTV ...
 Business Wire (press release) - San Francisco,CA,USA
 The alliance will further empower Tech Mahindra in its quest to implement best-performing IPTV solutions and support
cutting-edge technologies in ...

 Amino introduces all-digital HD IPTV set-top box
 IPTV News - UK
 June 17, 2008 - Amino has launched an all-digital high-definition IPTV set-top box at the NXTcomm event currently
taking place in Las Vegas, ...

 Tech Mahindra ties up with Microsoft media room for IPTV
 Sify - Chennai,Tamil Nadu,India
 ... (SI) requirements for deployments of the award-winning Microsoft Mediaroom Internet Protocol Television (IPTV) and
multimedia software platform. ...

 IPTV, BT Vision, Advertising
 SourceWire (press release) - London,UK
 ... the distinction of being the first advertising campaign to launch on the BT Vision, BT&rsquo;s next-generation digital
TV service, IPTV platform in the UK. ...

 Tech Mahindra in IPTV Deal with Software Giant
 CXOToday.com - Mumbai,India
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 ... System Integration (SI) requirements for deployments of the Microsoft Mediaroom Internet Protocol Television (IPTV)
and multi-media software platform. ...

 

 China Telecom launches tender for over 500000 IPTV set-top boxes
 IPTV News - UK
 June 17, 2008 - China Telecom has launched a tender for 574000 IPTV set-top boxes, with each provincial branch in
the country handling its own acquisition ... 

 Ericsson to demonstrate 10 Gbps GPON for IPTV at NXTcomm08
 Telecom Paper (subscription) - Houten,Netherlands
 Ericsson will demonstrate the EDA 1500 GPON system, a 10 Gbps gigabit passive optical network system for IPTV with
four times the bandwidth of existing GPON ...  Sri Lanka Telecom Eyes IPTV Services
 CXOToday.com - Mumbai,India
 According to MRG that publishes the semi-annual IPTV Global Market Leader Report, the global IPTV network Capital
Expenditure (CAPEX) will grow at 16 % CAGR ...  Aksh launches IPTV without broadband connection
 Business Standard - Mumbai,Maharashtra,India
 PTI / New Delhi June 17, 2008, 18:23 IST Aksh Optifibres in association with telecom firm MTNL launched country's first
Internet Protocol Television (IPTV) ...  
  Ericsson to power IPTV and mobile channels for Volvo Ocean Race
 CNNMoney.com - USA
 At this year's Volvo Ocean Race viewers can keep up to date with the latest developments via live mobile TV, or through
IPTV in each race village, ...  IneoQuest Technologies Selected for Microsoft Mediaroom IPTV Ecosystem
 Market Wire (press release) - USA
 The collaboration will ensure service providers using the Microsoft Mediaroom IPTV and multimedia software platform
can meet subscriber video quality ...  UTStarcom Selected by Sri Lanka Telecom to Launch IPTV Services on ...
 Earthtimes (press release) - London,UK
 SLT, a provider of international and domestic voice, Internet, and data services, will use the RollingStream platform to
bring IPTV services to its growing ...  Amino Debuts Digital HD IPTV Set Top Box at NXTcomm08
 TMCnet - USA
 By Nathesh, TMCnet Contributing Editor At the NXTcomm08 conference in Las Vegas this week, Amino introduced what
it claims is the IPTV market&rsquo;s completely ...  IPTV is your plain old TV, reinvented
 Televisionpoint.com - Mumbai,Maharashtra,India
 "The future of television is internet protocol television (IPTV) as it makes TV personalised," says Manjunath Naik,
regional manager, sales and marketing, ...  Has IPTV hit the tipping point?
 TelephonyOnline - USA
 Microsoft&rsquo;s announcement today of new ecosystem partners for its Microsoft Mediaroom IPTV system is intended
to underscore the faster pace at which IPTV is ...  Shenick's Enhanced Black Screen Error and Audio Cut-Out Detection ...
 Centre Daily Times - Centre,PA,USA
 Detecting video and audio errors quickly means that IPTV providers can reduce customer churn and prevent revenue
loss. Shenick will be showcasing its ...   Aksh launches IPTV-icontrol
 Myiris.com - Mumbai,Maharashtra,India
 Aksh Optifibres and state-run MTNL have launched Internet Protocol Television (IPTV), which could be viewed without
any broadband connection, ... 
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